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This trio of short stories by the author of Madame Bovary were the last of Flaubert's works published in his
lifetime, and their ambitious range reaches from the 19th century back to the Middle Ages and to ancient
Israel. "A Simple Heart," in Flaubert's own words, "is just the account of an obscure life, that of Félicité a
poor country girl, pious but mystical, quietly devoted, and as tender as fresh bread." "The Legend of Saint
Julian the Hospitaller" concerns a hunter and warrior whose attempts to escape dire prophecy ultimately lead
to a state of grace. "Herodias," based on the legends surrounding King Herod, Salome, and John the Baptist,
served as the inspiration for later interpretations by Oscar Wilde and Jules Massenet. Translated by Arthur
McDowall.
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From reader reviews:

Alma Medina:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has several
personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't need do that.
You must know how great as well as important the book Three Tales. All type of book is it possible to see on
many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Meredith Bailey:

Do you among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This Three Tales book is readable simply by you who hate those straight word
style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving possibly
decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer associated with Three Tales content conveys the
thought easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content
but it just different such as it. So , do you continue to thinking Three Tales is not loveable to be your top
listing reading book?

Teresa Dawkins:

Typically the book Three Tales has a lot details on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of profit.
The book was authored by the very famous author. The author makes some research previous to write this
book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this book.

Bessie Scudder:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Three Tales can be the response, oh how comes? A
fresh book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand new era is
common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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