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It’s hard to be committed to anyone when you don’t know whom to trust.

Alexis Toles, a former FBI agent turned undercover CIA agent, is quickly finding that out in Nancy Ann
Healy’s newest political thriller, Commitment.

Alex embeds in a secret organization of intelligence operatives known as The Collaborative. Its partners
include operatives from the CIA, National Security Agency, FBI, US Department of Defense, and an
entanglement of foreign intelligence agencies.

It’s about half a year after the death of President John Merrow, a friend and someone she respected. But she
remains committed to overthrowing The Collaborative as she works with a onetime adversary who believes
the organization’s involved in the president’s death.

Meanwhile Alex; her wife, Cassidy O’Brien; and Cassidy’s son try hard to live as a family but must first
overcome personal struggles, including a nasty custody battle with Cassidy’s ex-husband, Congressman
Christopher O’Brien. The family has their own share of secrets that, if unleashed, could affect their hopes for
the future.

There’s no place to turn without discovering people who are not who they claim to be. That can’t stop Alex.
She must remain committed to the cause, both at home and as she works against The Collaborative.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Page:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled Commitment?
Maybe it is being best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time along with your
favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have other opinion?

Marilyn Washington:

This Commitment book is not really ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The
benefit you get by reading this book is actually information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get
info which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This Commitment without
we comprehend teach the one who looking at it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't be worry
Commitment can bring whenever you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full
because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cellphone. This Commitment having good arrangement in
word as well as layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Betsy Aguilar:

The particular book Commitment has a lot of information on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot
of profit. The book was written by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research previous to write
this book. This specific book very easy to read you can find the point easily after reading this article book.

Debra Capone:

You may spend your free time you just read this book this guide. This Commitment is simple to create you
can read it in the area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not have got much space to bring often
the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save often the
book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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