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A young woman's fatal battle with anorexia, in her own words

In the tradition of Go Ask Alice, Prozac Nation, and Girl Interrupted, Slim to None grants readers precious
access to the emotional and psychological underpinnings of its author. Step-by-step, readers follow Jenny's
long journey through a "wasteland" of failed treatments and therapies, false hope, and abuse by the mental
health system that kept her captive most of her life.

Although this disease has been at the forefront of public awareness for years, anorexia continues to claim
more victims than any other mental illness. Slim to None reveals the glaring inadequacy of the mental health
system to treat and fully understand this disease.

The first journal of an anorexic to be published posthumously, the book discloses the innermost thoughts,
fears, and hopes of a young girl stricken and fighting to recover.

Jenny Hendricks painstakingly recorded her experiences as she suffered from and eventually succumbed to
this eating disorder. With candor, she recounts being shipped from one doctor to another and subjected to
widely varying treatments--all of which ultimately proved unsuccessful. Her father, Gordon Hendricks, fills
in this compelling narrative with his own memories of his daughter's struggle.
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From reader reviews:

Tammy Crider:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write about the data
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or
daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some study before they write on their book. One of them is this Slim to
None.

Houston Boynton:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, limited story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not hoping Slim to None that give your pleasure
preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as
the opportunity for people to know world considerably better then how they react in the direction of the
world. It can't be stated constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you
who wants to be success person. So , for every you who want to start reading through as your good habit, it is
possible to pick Slim to None become your personal starter.

Kevin Zavala:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its protect may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in
the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer is usually Slim to None why because the amazing cover that
make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is usually
fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Judy Yelle:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you read a book
you can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, since book has a
lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you have
read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you act like
you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon. The Slim to
None will give you a new experience in looking at a book.
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